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INTRODUCTION  

EXECUTIVE STATEMENT  

This study is a Thematic Heritage Study for Dunedin City presented in 
two volumes. 

Volume 1 is a overview history of Dunedin written around a series of 14 
themes and 89 associated sub-themes which were developed by the 
consultant team and refined through Council and community 
involvement. 

Volume 2 examines existing District Plan heritage schedules in light of 
these themes, listing existing heritage items, identifying gaps, making 
recommendations for further additions to the schedules and identifying 
further areas of study. The report concludes with a number of specific 
recommendations.   

An appendix to this volume contains maps of proposed rural towns and 
heritage landscapes for further study, a map outlining chronological 
development  patterns in Dunedin and a number of maps of the city and 
suburbs from 1909 - 1921  

 

PURPOSE AND SCOPE 

The Dunedin City Council brief was to prepare a thematic heritage study 
for the City which will form the basis for a review and future update of 
the heritage schedules in its District Plan.   

The study attempts to identify a comprehensive range of tangible and 
intangible heritage values and items including built and modified 
landscapes, places, structures and features that define Dunedin as a 
unique place within New Zealand. It attempts to be inclusive of all 
values which represent the cultural diversity of Dunedin, but it is noted 
that a project focusing on the Maori heritage will be undertaken as a 
separate exercise. 

The study is not intended to be an extensive research document but 
rather the first part of a potentially multi-staged project to initiate the 
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ongoing and more detailed process of identifying places of historic 
significance.  It is seen as an organic framework that can be added to 
and developed as information is confirmed, new information comes to 
light and goals are revised. This will have a particular relevance if it is to 
become a dynamic document in the ‘Wikipedia type’ format. 

It is expected that broad public scrutiny of the report will provide the 
catalyst to allow individuals and community groups to expand the history 
as an ongoing project, defining Dunedin as a unique place through the 
continued occupation of the city and its surrounds 

Thematic frameworks have been widely used overseas, and 
increasingly in New Zealand, to focus on an area as a ‘cultural 
landscape’, a concept that is used to understand historic heritage in the 
widest context.   

“Cultural landscapes are cultural properties and represent the 
‘combined works of nature and of man’ designated in Article 1 of the 
World Heritage Convention. They are illustrative of the evolution of 
human society and settlement over time, under the influence of the 
physical constraints and/or opportunities presented by their natural 
environment and of successive social, economic and cultural forces, 
both external and internal.” [Operational Guidelines for the 
Implementation of the World Heritage Convention, Unesco, January 
2008] 

The themes have been specifically tailored to Dunedin, based on 
themes developed elsewhere in Australia and America, and also using 
New Zealand models formulated by the New Zealand Historic Places 
Trust and the Department of Conservation. The themes were further 
developed and tested by the consultant team, the Council Steering 
Group and through the stakeholder workshops.  

The thematic analysis has identified a range of protected items across 
all areas, although no assessment has been made on how 
representative these may be, nor whether they are the most appropriate 
examples. 
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RESEARCH AND CONSULTATION UNDERTAKEN 

The Dunedin City brief identified the following tasks: 

 Review of all background material including primary and secondary 
source material, comprising written records, maps, photos and other 
documents and background for the history and to guide development 
of the thematic framework. 

 Review and evaluation of New Zealand Historic Places Trust listings 
contained in the District Plan to highlight gaps in the heritage 
schedules.  

 Development of the thematic framework.   

 Site visits and field recording and assessment by all consultants, to 
review current heritage schedules. 

 Liaison with Council Officers and community representatives, 
including two facilitated stakeholder workshops (23 & 24 April) to 
refine and develop themes.  

 Review of existing District Plan heritage schedules, identifying gaps 
and making recommendations for further research. (No detailed 
archival research was carried out on individual listed places or 
items.) 

 Preparation of draft and final document with internal and Council 
peer review.  

 Preparation of final report in hard copy and electronic version to 
Council. 

 Public release of document. 

 

AUTHORSHIP  

This Thematic Contextual Overview for Dunedin City has been 
produced by Michael Findlay with input from consultants Peter Petchey 
(archaeologist), Richard Bollard (Salmond Reed Architects) John Adam 
(Endangered Gardens) and project coordinator, Bruce Petry (Salmond 
Reed Architects).  
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